
  
 

 
  

 
 
Ref: FOI/00097/CMICB 
27 October 2022 
  
 
 
 
Your Request: 
 

1) Could you provide your actual inpatient rates for Transforming Care 
(learning disabilities & autism) patients for each year since 2015 to present. 
 
2) Could you provide your target rate for Transforming Care (learning 
disabilities & autism) patients for each corresponding year? 
 

Our Response: 
 
1 - 2) Please find listed below the data held for the whole of the NHS Cheshire 
& Merseyside ICB area in terms of actual versus planned admissions, broken 
down by ‘all patients/social care (SC)/CCG patients. Please note that there was 
no planned target prior to the 2018/19 year or data held prior to 2017/18. 
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Your Request: 

 
3) Since 2015, have you required NHS England intervention or oversight at 
any stage relating to your delivery of Transforming Care services? 
 
4) How many of your inpatients since 2015 have been discharged into 
private hospital or healthcare settings? 
 
5) How much have you spent on delivering Transforming Care services each 
year since 2015? 
 
6) If mechanical restraint is used within your organisation, how many 
recorded instances of its use have there been each year since 2015? 

0

10

20

30

40

50

60

70
Ap

r-
18

Ju
l-1

8

O
ct

-1
8

Ja
n-

19

Ap
r-

19

Ju
l-1

9

O
ct

-1
9

Ja
n-

20

Ap
r-

20

Ju
l-2

0

O
ct

-2
0

Ja
n-

21

Ap
r-

21

Ju
l-2

1

O
ct

-2
1

Ja
n-

22

Ap
r-

22

Ju
l-2

2

Cheshire and Merseyside ICB Actual vs Planned, SC patients

SC Inpatients SC Planned

0
10
20
30
40
50
60
70
80
90

Ap
r-

18

Ju
l-1

8

O
ct

-1
8

Ja
n-

19

Ap
r-

19

Ju
l-1

9

O
ct

-1
9

Ja
n-

20

Ap
r-

20

Ju
l-2

0

O
ct

-2
0

Ja
n-

21

Ap
r-

21

Ju
l-2

1

O
ct

-2
1

Ja
n-

22

Ap
r-

22

Ju
l-2

2

Cheshire and Merseyside ICB Actual vs Planned, CCG patients

CCG Inpatients SC Planned



 
 
 
 
 

Page 3 of 5 

7) If mechanical restraint is used within your organisation, what are the 
methods of mechanical restraint currently used? 
 
8) How often are these methods and guidelines reviewed and, if necessary, 
updated? 
 

Our Response: 
 

Please find listed below the information held regarding the questions posed in 
respect of Transforming Care for the former CCG areas that now make up NHS 
Cheshire & Merseyside ICB:  
 
Cheshire 
3) Weekly report submitted to NHSE which details discharge progress and any 
barriers to discharge. 
4) There are currently 9 Adult TCP inpatients in independent hospitals and 11 
Adult TCP inpatients in NHS hospitals with no plans to transfer them to any 
private hospital. We are unable to provide information 2015 – 2019. 
5) Information not held prior to 2019/20.  

2015/16 2016/17 2017/18 2018/19 2019/20 2020/21 2021/22 
 

(£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) 

Cheshire - - - - 1,756 4,326 5,926 

6, 7 & 8) Information not held. You may wish to redirect your request for this 
information to Cheshire & Wirral Partnership NHS Foundation Trust who can be 
contacted for Freedom of Information requests via: cwp.foi@nhs.net.  

 
Halton 
3) No. 
4) Less than 5 patients. 
5) The accounting ledger for the former NHS Halton CCG does not split 
Transforming Care activity specifically for Learning Disabilities and Autism since 
2015, therefore an accurate sum cannot be provided 
6, 7 & 8) Information not held. You may wish to redirect your request for this 
information to Bridgewater Community Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust who 
can be contacted for Freedom of Information requests via: bchft.foi@nhs.net. 

 
Knowsley 
3) No. 
4) 2 patients. 
5)   

2015/16 2016/17 2017/18 2018/19 2019/20 2020/21 2021/22 
 

(£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) 

Knowsley 0 0 0 152 200 137 81 

mailto:cwp.foi@nhs.net
mailto:bchft.foi@nhs.net
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6, 7 & 8) Information not held. You may wish to redirect your request for this 
information to Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust who can be contacted for 
Freedom of Information requests via: FOI@merseycare.nhs.uk.  

 
Liverpool 
3) Liverpool transforming care programme has NHS England oversight and 
support in terms of tracking progress on admissions and discharges and 
improvements made in relation to patient care. Liverpool Place has fortnightly 
tracker meetings with local partners and providers which includes NHS England 
as and when required. 
4) Data only held from 2018/19 to 2022, which is a total of 28 patients. 
5) Please find listed below the spend with non-NHS providers.  

2015/16 2016/17 2017/18 2018/19 2019/20 2020/21 2021/22 
 

(£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) 

Liverpool 642 1,311 2,354 1,845 2,434 2,713 4,545 

Information not held in respect of spend with NHS providers as these services 
are operated as part of wider block contracts with Mersey Care NHS 
Foundation Trust, with client numbers/individual costs not available. 
6, 7 & 8) Information not held. You may wish to redirect your request for this 
information to Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust who can be contacted for 
Freedom of Information requests via: FOI@merseycare.nhs.uk.  

 
South Sefton / Southport & Formby 
3) No. 
4) Information not held. 
5)  

2015/16 2016/17 2017/18 2018/19 2019/20 2020/21 2021/22 
 

(£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) 

South 
Sefton 

563 671 571 906 1,351 1,094 2,145 

Southport 
& Formby 

1286 1,133 1,306 1,094 1,267 1,146 1,067 

6, 7 & 8) Information not held. You may wish to redirect your request for this 
information to Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust who can be contacted for 
Freedom of Information requests via: FOI@merseycare.nhs.uk.  

 
St Helens 
3 - 8) Information not received from former St Helens CCG area at the time of 
this response. Please accept our apologies and we will provide the requested 
information for the former St Helens CCG area under separate cover to you 
once it is received.  

 
Warrington 
3) No. 
4) 5 patients. 

mailto:FOI@merseycare.nhs.uk
mailto:FOI@merseycare.nhs.uk
mailto:FOI@merseycare.nhs.uk
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5) The accounting ledger for the former NHS Warrington CCG does not split 
Transforming Care activity specifically for Learning Disabilities and Autism since 
2015, therefore an accurate sum cannot be provided 
6, 7 & 8) Information not held. You may wish to redirect your request for this 
information to Bridgewater Community Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust who 
can be contacted for Freedom of Information requests via: bchft.foi@nhs.net. 

 
Wirral 
3) Wirral work in close conjunction with NHS England on the delivery of the 
Transforming Care Programme, including regular reviews and audits. There is a 
monthly desk top review with NHS England to discuss inpatients, a weekly 
Wirral system wide call to discuss all inpatients and those in hospital are offered 
Care and Treatment Reviews at appropriate points.  
4) Data only held from 2019, which is nil. 
5) Information only held for the 2020/21 and 2021/22 financial years.  

2015/16 2016/17 2017/18 2018/19 2019/20 2020/21 2021/22 
 

(£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) (£ '000) 

Wirral - - - - - 2,752 3,420 

6, 7 & 8) Information not held. You may wish to redirect your request for this 
information to Cheshire & Wirral Partnership NHS Foundation Trust, who can 
be contacted for Freedom of Information requests via: cwp.foi@nhs.net.  
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